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Tabulation of Bid #17447
DOOR PANIC DEVICES / JP

NAME OF BIDDER TERMS AMOUNT DESCRIPTION
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Request #241646
Item #1 Quantity: 1200.00 EA. Stock #7505440
DEVICE, DOOR, PANIC, RIM, #28 FINISH
36" SIZE, #99EO VON DUPRIN
.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
*ACE DOOR & REPAIR (IRVING, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 *182.25 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
ACE LOCK & SECURITY SUPPLY (UNION, NJ) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 235.80 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
CLARK SECURITY (HOUSTON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 236.50 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
DALLAS DOOR & SUPPLY CO (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 287.00 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
EWERT WHOLESALE HARDWARE INC (ALSIP, IL) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 252.60 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
HANS JOHNSEN COMPANY (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 236.48 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
IDN ACME INC (RICHARDSON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 240.66 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Request #241646
Item #3 Quantity: 1000.00 EA. Stock #7505500
TURNKNOB, DISC, SQUARE HOLE, MERIT
METAL #MM280, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
*ACE DOOR & REPAIR (IRVING, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 *0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
ACE LOCK & SECURITY SUPPLY (UNION, NJ) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.83 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
CLARK SECURITY (HOUSTON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
DALLAS DOOR & SUPPLY CO (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
EWERT WHOLESALE HARDWARE INC (ALSIP, IL) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 8.99 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
HANS JOHNSEN COMPANY (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
IDN ACME INC (RICHARDSON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 8.14 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Request #241646
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Item #4 Quantity: 1000.00 EA. Stock #7505505
THUMB TURN, OVAL, WITH SQUARE
TAILPIECE, 26D FINISH, PROGRESSIVE
HDW #PH76 26D
.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
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DOOR PANIC DEVICES / JP

NAME OF BIDDER TERMS AMOUNT DESCRIPTION
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
*ACE DOOR & REPAIR (IRVING, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 *0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
ACE LOCK & SECURITY SUPPLY (UNION, NJ) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.14 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
CLARK SECURITY (HOUSTON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 3.11 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
DALLAS DOOR & SUPPLY CO (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
EWERT WHOLESALE HARDWARE INC (ALSIP, IL) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.46 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
HANS JOHNSEN COMPANY (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.27 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
IDN ACME INC (RICHARDSON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.94 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Request #241646
Item #5 Quantity: 400.00 EA. Stock #7505510
SET SCREW PACKET, MORTISE CYLINDER
CORBIN RUSSWIN #488F08-8
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
*ACE DOOR & REPAIR (IRVING, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 *0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
ACE LOCK & SECURITY SUPPLY (UNION, NJ) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.28 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
CLARK SECURITY (HOUSTON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.26 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
DALLAS DOOR & SUPPLY CO (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.40 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
EWERT WHOLESALE HARDWARE INC (ALSIP, IL) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.28 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
HANS JOHNSEN COMPANY (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
IDN ACME INC (RICHARDSON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 0.30 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Request #241646
Item #6 Quantity: 400.00 EA. Stock #7505515
COMPRESSION RING, MORTISE CYLINDER
626 FINISH, SCHLAGE #36-083, 626
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
*ACE DOOR & REPAIR (IRVING, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 *0.00 EA. NO BID
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
ACE LOCK & SECURITY SUPPLY (UNION, NJ) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.50 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
CLARK SECURITY (HOUSTON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.42 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
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DALLAS DOOR & SUPPLY CO (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.35 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
EWERT WHOLESALE HARDWARE INC (ALSIP, IL) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 5.26 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
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-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
HANS JOHNSEN COMPANY (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.65 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
IDN ACME INC (RICHARDSON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 2.72 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Request #241646
Item #7 Quantity: 600.00 EA. Stock #7505520
VERICAL ROD DEVICE, SURFACE MOUNTED
3 FT., US28 FINISH, VON DUPRIN
9927EO, LBR
.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
*ACE DOOR & REPAIR (IRVING, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 *247.85 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
ACE LOCK & SECURITY SUPPLY (UNION, NJ) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 343.95 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
CLARK SECURITY (HOUSTON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 344.94 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
DALLAS DOOR & SUPPLY CO (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 420.00 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
EWERT WHOLESALE HARDWARE INC (ALSIP, IL) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 368.45 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
HANS JOHNSEN COMPANY (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 412.98 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
IDN ACME INC (RICHARDSON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 351.68 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Request #241646
Item #8 Quantity: 500.00 EA. Stock #7505480
MULLION, FOR VON DUPRIN PANIC RIM
DEVICES, TWO #299 STRIKES, SPRAYED
ALUMINUM FINISH SP28, 8 FT. 2 IN.,
#4954. NO SUBSTITUTION
.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
*ACE DOOR & REPAIR (IRVING, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 136.50 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
ACE LOCK & SECURITY SUPPLY (UNION, NJ) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 *129.80 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
CLARK SECURITY (HOUSTON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 153.47 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
DALLAS DOOR & SUPPLY CO (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 175.00 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
EWERT WHOLESALE HARDWARE INC (ALSIP, IL) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 166.95 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
HANS JOHNSEN COMPANY (DALLAS, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 153.48 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
IDN ACME INC (RICHARDSON, TX) 0.0%, 0 NET 30 156.45 EA.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
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-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Bid/Quote Summary
Total number of bids requested: 36
Total number of compliant bids received: 7
Total number of BLACK FEMALE bids requested: 2
Total number of BLACK FEMALE bids received: 0
Total number of BLACK MALE bids requested: 2
Total number of BLACK MALE bids received: 0
Total number of HISPANIC MAL bids requested: 2
Total number of HISPANIC MAL bids received: 1
Total number of NATV AMER MA bids requested: 1
Total number of NATV AMER MA bids received: 0
Total number of WHITE FEMALE bids requested: 5
Total number of WHITE FEMALE bids received: 0
Total number of all minority bids requested: 12
Total number of all minority bids received: 1



7


